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SECTION 8 HOUSING CHOICE VOUCHER  
FREQUENTLY ASKED QUESTIONS 

 
 
PLEASE NOTE:  This application is for Tenant-Based Section 8 Housing Choice Voucher Program 
Assistance and Project-Based Section 8 Rental Assistance at Lyceum Heights Building 1 and Lyceum 
Heights Building 2.  If you would also like to apply for Project-Based Section 8 Rental Assistance at 
the SPA APARTMENTS in Clifton Springs, you must request an additional application, either from 
Geneva Housing Authority’s Main Office or the Spa Apartments.  The Application for Spa Apartments 
MUST be submitted to the Spa Apartments at 11 East Main Street, Clifton Springs, NY. 
 
 
 
SECTION 8 INCOME LIMITS, effective April 1, 2020 (total annual household income) 
 
      PERSONS            INCOME         PERSONS         INCOME     
   
      1  $26,750  5  $41,300 
  2  $30,600  6  $44,350 
 3  $34,400  7  $47,400 
 4  $38,200  8  $50,450   
      
  
WHAT HAPPENS AFTER I SUBMIT MY APPLICATION? 
 
Each application is stamped with the date and time as soon as it is received in the GHA office.  It is then 
reviewed to determine eligibility.  A preliminary eligibility determination is made, based on the total annual 
income and household size.  Eligible applications are placed on the waiting list in the order that they are 
received.  A letter is sent to the applicant to notify them of whether or not they are eligible. 
 
WHY DOES MY APPLICATION HAVE TO GO ON A WAITING LIST? 
 
The Geneva Housing Authority is given a limited number of vouchers to issue and is not  allowed to issue 
more than that number.  We do not have enough vouchers to issue to everyone who needs them, so 
applications are placed on the waiting list until there is a voucher available. 
 
WHAT IF YOU TELL ME MY HOUSEHOLD IS NOT ELIGIBLE AND I DON'T AGREE? 
 
There is a review process for ineligible applicants.  If your eligibility letter tells you that you are not eligible, 
it will also tell you how to request a review. 
 
HOW SOON WILL YOU BE ABLE TO HELP ME? 
 
It is not possible to tell you how long it will be before you are contacted with an offer of assistance.  
Processing of applications generally takes 2 - 3 weeks, and you should receive your eligibility notification 
within 4 weeks of submitting your application.  After that, it will depend on when your application was 
submitted.  Some offers of assistance will go out right away, but on an ongoing basis, it will depend on 
vouchers becoming available, and position on the waiting list.  Our waiting lists have at times been over 
three years long. 
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ARE THERE ANY CATEGORIES OF PEOPLE THAT YOU ASSIST SOONER THAN OTHERS? 
 
For single-person households only, applicants who are elderly, disabled or handicapped will be assisted 
ahead of other single-person households. 
 
HUD also requires that the GHA give priority to assisting applicants in the lowest income categories.  This 
means that sometimes we have to skip over higher income applicants.  The higher income families do remain 
on the waiting list, but they may have to wait longer for their offer of assistance. 
 
HOW MUCH WILL YOU PAY TOWARD MY RENT? 
 
It is impossible to tell you at this point how much assistance you may receive.  The calculation is based on a 
number of factors, which all have to be verified at the time that assistance begins.  Assistance is based 
mainly on total household income and number of dependents, however, the amount of the rent, and what 
utilities you have to pay for will also make a difference.  A way to get a rough estimate of how much you 
would be required to pay toward rent and utilities is to calculate 30% of your total household monthly gross 
income.  However, you must keep in mind that we make adjustments to income for certain things, and also 
that the higher the rent is, the higher your payment is likely to be.  So this is ONLY an ESTIMATE. 
 
WHAT IF MY ADDRESS, INCOME OR HOUSEHOLD COMPOSITION CHANGES? 
 
You MUST notify the Geneva Housing Authority if your mailing address changes, because our notifications 
are done by mail.  If we can't reach you by mail, your application will be removed from the waiting list.  You 
would then have to re-apply and be placed at the bottom of the list. 
 
You should also notify the GHA office if your household composition changes, as this may affect your 
position on the waiting list. 
 
In most cases, changes in income DO NOT need to be reported while you are on the waiting list, since 
income will be verified when you are called in off the waiting list.  You only need to report a change in your 
income if you have met with someone from our office and they have told you to do so. 
 
I PLAN TO MOVE SOON.  SHOULD I LOOK FOR ANYTHING IN PARTICULAR AT MY NEW 
PLACE? 
 
Because there is no way of knowing how soon GHA will be able to assist you, we will NOT advise you as to 
what to look for in a new apartment until you are issued a voucher.  You should proceed as you normally 
would to find a new place.  When we have a  voucher available for you, you will be required to attend a 
briefing, where we will give you the information you will need and answer your questions. 
 
SHOULD I CALL THE GHA TO ASK QUESTIONS? 
 
We ask that you save your questions about how the program works for the briefing session that you will 
attend when you are called in off the waiting list.   
 
Please do not call to ask about your position on the waiting list.  We do not give out waiting list numbers, 
and we also cannot predict how long you may be on the list.  When there is a voucher available, you will be 
notified. 
 
You should call if you have not received an eligibility letter within 4 weeks of submitting your application. 
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